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Insurance companies, as well as banks and thrift institutions,
have traditionally reported assets and liabilities on the basis of
their amortized cost, or book value. But following the turmoil
in securities markets due to highly volatile interest rate
fluctuations in the 1980s and the early 1990s, and problems
caused by inadequate liquidity, in the mid-1990s the Financial
Accounting Standards Board (FASB) issued a new ruling
calling for financial intermediaries to report the fair, or
market, value of most assets. Called FAS 115, this new standard
is the first step in the eventual change to valuing all the assets
and liabilities belonging to financial intermediaries under the
fair value accounting method. Thus, these changes will pose
tremendous future implications for three key business
measures of a financial intermediary:Solvency: if the fair
values of assets and liabilities are out-of-step, then healthy
companies may report negative net worth and insolvent
companies may appear to be in sound financial condition.
Reported Earnings: if the fair values of assets and liabilities are
out of step, then reported earnings will not accurately
represent the financial operations of the company. Risk
Management: FASB recently postponed the implementation of
its new...

R EAD O NLINE  
[ 8.15 MB  ]    

R eviews

If you need to adding benefit, a must buy book. I could comprehended every thing out of this composed e pdf. I am just
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